
8th Grade Year-End Events: Behavioral and Academic Expectations Rubric

We have planned our traditional year-end activities and events for 8th graders. It is our hope that all

students participate, but the events are special celebrations of the student and his/her time at Link and

they are a privilege, rather than a right. To be able to participate in these events, students must continue

to live the Core Values. If a student does not, he or she may be excluded from an activity/event. Here is

a rubric that will determine if a student may participate in year-end events:

Event Field Day 8th Grade Dance 8th Grade Class Trip

Tentative: Philadelphia
(no refund of payments

made)

Graduation Events:
Breakfast and Awards
Ceremony and
Commencement

Event Date Thurs, June 6, 2024 Fri., May 31, 2024 Fri., June 7, 2024 Thurs., June 20, 2024

Time Frame From the start of
Quarter 3 to the event
date

From the start of
Quarter 3 to the
event date

From the start of
Quarter 3 to the event
date

From the start of
Quarter 3 to the event
date

A student may
participate in
this event or
activity if
he/she:

Has 15 weeks with a
DeansList balance of
80 points or more

Has 14 weeks with a
DeansList balance of
80 points or more

Has 15 weeks with a
DeansList balance of
80 points or more

Has not been
suspended

Has not been
suspended

Has not been
suspended

Has not been
suspended

Has not had more
than 2 administrative
redemptions

Has not had more
than 2 administrative
redemptions

Has not had more
than 2 administrative
redemptions

The administration
may use discretion in
allowing a student to
participate or not.

The administration
may use discretion in
allowing a student to
participate or not.

The administration
may use discretion in
allowing a student to
participate or not.

The administration may
use discretion in
allowing a student to
participate or not.

Has a passing grade in
all core classes for the
year

(Failure in one or more
core classes precludes
a student from this
event.)

Has a passing grade
in all core classes for
the year

(Failure in one or
more core classes
precludes a student
from this event.)

Has a passing grade in
all core classes for the
year

(Failure in one or more
core classes precludes
a student from this
event.)

Has a passing grade in
all core classes for the
year

(Failure in one or more
core classes precludes a
student from this
event.)


